Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

<u>Buyers</u> Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti** NIGP-CPP, CPPB Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

#### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN: GARY MCLEAN JR ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY 22607 MURROCK CIRCLE WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR DYNA PAC, KOMATSU, SALSCO

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. McLean:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

**√** Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, Alta Equipment Co., United Construction & Forestry, Tracey Road

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

<u>Buyers</u> Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti**NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN PATRICIA LEPAGLIA CONWAY BEAM TRUCK GROUP 22048 SALMON RUN MALL ROAD WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR -

**MACK AND VOLVO TRUCKS** 

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Ms. LaPaglia:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

V Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Milton Cat, Alta Equipment Co., United Construction & Forestry, Tracey Road

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti** NIGP-CPP, CPPB Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN: JARED UTZ MILTON CAT 294 AINSLEY DRIVE SYRACUSE NY 13210

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR -

**CATERPILLAR** 

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Utz:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

**√** Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Equipment Co., United Construction & Forestry, Tracey Road

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti** NIGP-CPP, CPPB **Email Addresses:** 

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

#### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN JAMES KLINGER ALTA EQUIPMENT CO 5965 COURT ST ROAD SYRACUSE NY 13206

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR – BLAW KNOX, GRADALL, VOLVO CONSTRUCTION AND WOODS

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Klinger:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

V Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, United Construction & Forestry, Tracey Road

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077 Fax: 315-785-7591

<u>Buyers</u> Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti** NIGP-CPP, CPPB Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

#### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN: CHRIS BACKUS
UNITED CONSTRUCTION & FORESTRY
1486 US HIGHWAY 11
GOUVERNEUR NY 13642

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR – JOHN DEERE- CONSTRUCTION

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Backus:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

### The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

√ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability

**√** Proof of New York State Disability/Worker's Compensation

**V** W-9 Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

**V** Other: <u>Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.</u>

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, Alta Equipment Co., Tracey Road

Shared/Purchasing/Bid Book Fleet Related/Award 2021F-12a United Construction & Forestry

Office of the Purchasing Department Historic Court House 195 Arsenal Street Watertown, New York 13601-2565 Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Karin Dorr Amanda McCracken



<u>Director</u> **Mark Sachetti** NIGP-CPP, CPPB **Email Addresses:** 

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us karind@co.jefferson.ny.us amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

> Senior Account Clerk Avis Gilmore Account Clerk Mary Ann Shear

### **NOTICE OF AWARD**

November 30, 2021

ATTN JOHN DELONG TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT 19598 CADY ROAD ADAMS CENTER NY 13606

BID # 2021F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR -

**NEW HOLLAND CONSTRUCTION** 

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2021 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2023

Dear Mr. Delong:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

**√** Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, Alta Equipment Co., United Construction & Forestry

# BID #2021F-12a ROAD MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR BID TABULATION 12/1/21 - 10/31/23

					,		
		ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY	CONWAY BEAM TRUCK GROUP	MILTON CAT	ALTA EQUIPMENT CO Was Yantage Equipment	UNITED CONSTRUCTION & FORESTRY Was Nortrax	TRACEY ROÁD: EQUIPMENT
		FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/34/23 11/1/22 - 10/34/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22-10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/34/23 11/1/22 - 10/34/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD PART 1/32 - 10/34/33 11/1/32 - 10/34/33 11/1/32 - 10/34/33
ITEM#2 ALLMA	ALLMAND GENERATOR				***	200	CONTRACTOR
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	FACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$	/HB	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON	NOBID
<u>ΠΕΜ#4</u> : BLAWKNOX	KNOX	O.S.					
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	FACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20%	NO BID	OIB ON
LABOR RATE \$	НВ	NO BID	NO BID	OIS ON	\$150/HR \$155/HR	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	MILE	NOBID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.50/MILE \$4.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM#7 CASE	-				L		
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	FACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID	NO BID	ON BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE	/HR	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON .	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON
ROAD SERVICE RATE	/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM#8: CATERF	САТЕВРІІТАВ	The state of the s					
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	FACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	<b>20 20</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$	_ HB	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	MILE	NO BID	NO BID	Travel Time Travel Time \$118/HR \$120/HR \$3.00/MILE \$3.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #10: DYNA PAC	AC. SENERAL COMPANY OF THE PARTY OF THE PART	2,000					
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICELIST	FACTURER'S PRICE LIST	<b>20</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE	/HR	\$130/HR \$130/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	GI8 ON	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	MILE	\$135/HR \$40/HR \$3.25/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	O B ID	NO BID
ITEM #2: GRADALL	T)						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	ACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20%	NO BID	NO BID
LABORRATE	JHR I	O BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	\$150/HR \$155/HR	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.50/MILE \$4.00/MILE	OI8 ON	NO BID
ITEM #13: HAMM					-		
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	-ACTURER'S PRICE LIST	. OIB ON	OIB ON	GIB ON	NO BID	OI8 ON.	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$	/HR	NO BID	NO BID	OIS ON	NO BID	GI8 ON	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #72:	JOHN DEERE - CONSTRUCTION	XII. 3400	,				
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	ACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	QÌB ON	QI8 ON	NO BID		NO BID
LABOR RATE	HIB	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$170/HR. \$170/HR	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.25/MILE \$3.25/MILE	NO BID

## BID #2021F-12a ROAD MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR BID TABULATION 12/1/21 - 10/31/23

	ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY	CONWAY BEAM, TRUCK GROUP	MILTON CAT	ALTA EQUIPMENT CO Was Vantage Equipment	& FORESTRY Was Nortrax	TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT.
	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/10/22 - 10/3/23 11/10/22 - 10/3/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/122 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/122 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE FERIOD PERIOD 11/122 - 10/31/23 11/122 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 1/1/122 - 10/31/23 1/1/122 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 1/1/22 - 10/3/1/23 1/1/22 - 10/3/1/22 - 10/3/1/2
ITEM#18: KOMATSU						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	If order online 3% If order online 3%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$HB	\$130/HR \$130/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	\$135/HR \$140/MILE \$3.25/MILE \$3.25/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON
ITEM #19: LAND PRIDE						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	UO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$#B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO-BID
ITEM #20: LERO!						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	OIB ON
LABOR RATE \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	ON BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE   \$/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON .	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #2:						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	20% 20%	NO BID	QI8 ON	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$HB	OI9 ON	\$124/HR \$124/HR	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE \$2.00/MILE	NO BID	OIB ON .	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #22: NEW HOLLAND - AGRICULTURE			•			
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	· NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON	ON BID
ITEM #33: NEW HOLLAND - CONSTRUCTION						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	QIB ON	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON	x
LABOR RATE \$ / /HB	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON	\$141.00/HR \$141.00/HR
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON	\$3.25/MILE \$3.25/MILE
ITEM #25: ONAN/CUMMINS ON SITE GENERATORS						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID.	NO BID	ON BID	OI8 ON	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	OI8 ON	NO BID	GI8 ON
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #29: SALSCO	chandad fin d Admin Amelican's described Add Made and d D C C D C C C C C C C C C C C C C C					
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID.
LABOR RATE \$	\$130/HR \$130/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

# BID #2021F-12a ROAD MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR BID TABULATION 12/1/21 - 10/31/23

					The second secon	(INITED CONSTRAINT)	
		ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY	CONWAY BEAM TRUCK GROUP	MILTON CAT	ALTA EQUIPMENT CO Was Vantage Equipment	& FORESTRY Was Nortrax	TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT
	·	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/12 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD THILD: 10/34/23 11/122 - 10/34/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/23	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/1/22 - 10/3/123 11/1/22 - 10/3/123	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD 11/122 - 10/31/23 11/1/22 - 10/31/	FOR THE FOR THE PERIOD PERIOD THIS TO SHIP THE PERIOD PERIOD THIS TO SHIP THE PERIOD THIS TO SHIP THE PERIOD THIS THIS THIS THIS THIS THIS THIS THIS
ROAD SERVICE RATE		\$135/HR \$140/HR \$3.25/MILE \$3.25/MILE	NO BID .	NO BID			ON
1TEM #30: Ti	TIGER MOWERS						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM M	PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	QIB ON	NO BID	NO BID	ON BID
LABOR RATE	НВ	NO BID	ON BID	OIB ON	NO BID	OIB ON	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE	/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OIBON
TEM #22	VOLVO - TRUICKS / CONSTRUCTION		TRUCKS	:	CONSTRUCTION		
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM M	PARITS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	20%	NO BID	. 20%	NO BID	NO BID
IABOR RATE	JHR.	OB DN .	\$124/HR \$124/HR	NO BID	\$i5o/HR \$i55/HR	OB ON	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$\$	/MILE	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE \$2.00/MILE	NO BID	\$3.50/MILE \$4.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #33: W	WACKER						
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM M	PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$_	/нв	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$_	/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	OIB ON
ITEM#35: ₩	WOODS			2	CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY OF THE		
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM M	PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	OI8 ON	20%	NO BID	OIB ON
LABOR RATE \$	AB CONTROLLED IN THE CONTROL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$150/HR \$155/HR	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$	/МПЕ	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3-50/MILE \$4.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID
ONLINE ORDERING AVAILABLE:	YES / NO	YES	ON	YES	YES	NO ANSWER	ON
WARRANTY:						-	
COMMENTS:							
DEVIATIONS:	,	NO	ON	YES	YES - ALL PRICING SHALL BE FOB SHIPPING POINT, PREPAID & ADD TO INVOICE	ON	ON
NOVINAL IS DOD IN TACK IN	TO THE TAX STATES	TO TO TO THE TAIL OF THE TOTAL	J. 10.12.12.13	•			
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE	EINTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION O	ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BIT OFFINING, SUBJECT TO EKROKS OK OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON C	FERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT	EPARTMENT.			
THIS BID-TABULATION DOE	THIS BID THRULD TON DOES NOT MPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.	MADE UNLESS NOTED.					
		11/30/2021		-			-
PURCHASING		DATE					